
$1,720,000 - 127 Ahekolo St 13, Kihei
MLS® #404504 

$1,720,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,732 sqft
Residential on 0.17 Acres

Kilohana Ridge, Kihei, HI

Welcome to 127 Ahekolo, a stunning
3-bedroom, 2-bath single-story home in the
highly sought-after Kilohana Ridge
development. This home features a private,
tropical landscaped yard and a covered lanai,
perfect for enjoying your morning coffee or
evening pau hana drink. The primary bedroom
includes a cozy lanai, offering a seamless
indoor/outdoor living experience.   The kitchen
was recently updated in 2022 with new
appliances, as well was the solar water heater,
and supporting panels. With 32 owned
photovoltaic panels and an integrated car
charging system, you'll enjoy energy efficiency
and sustainability.   The Kilohana community
borders Wailea in South Maui and is just a
short distance from the world-famous
Keawakapu Beach, known for its stunning
turquoise waters and expansive shoreline.
Simply unpack and start enjoying the Maui
lifestyle!

Built in 2003

Essential Information

MLS® # 404504

Price $1,720,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 1,732

Land Tenure Fee Simple

Acres 0.17



Year Built 2003

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Sold Price $1,720,000

Community Information

Address 127 Ahekolo St 13

Area Kihei

Subdivision Kilohana Ridge

City Kihei

State HI

Zip Code 96753

Amenities

Parking Garage, Garage Door Opener

# of Garages 2

View Garden

Waterfront None

Vacation Rental No

Interior

Interior Features Ceiling Fan(s), Furnished, Inventory

Appliances Dishwasher, Disposal, Dryer, Microwave, Range, Refrigerator, Solar Hot
Water, Washer

Cooling Central Air

Stories One

Exterior

Windows Blinds, Drapes

Additional Information

Date Listed January 1st, 2025

Days on Market 70

Zoning Residential

HOA Fees Freq. Semi-Annually

Listing Details

Listing Office Coldwell Banker Island Prop(S)
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