
$1,750,000 - 5432 Lower Honapiilani Rd 1,
Napili/Kahana/Honokowai
MLS® #402581 

$1,750,000
3 Bedroom, 2.50 Bathroom, 1,431 sqft
Residential on 0.97 Acres

Napili Gardens, Napili/Kahana/Honokowai, HI

Step into your own slice of paradise at The
Residence at Napili Bay! This stunning
property offers the ultimate combination of
luxury and convenience, with a prime location
just steps away from the pristine sands of
Napili Bay. Imagine waking up to the gentle
sound of waves crashing against the shore
and spending your days basking in the warm
Hawaiian sun.  This exquisite gated residence
boasts 3 bedrooms, 2.5 bathrooms, and 1431
sq.ft of meticulously designed living space,
ensuring ample room for relaxation and
entertaining, Did I mention the private 2-car
garage?  From the moment you step through
the door, you'll be greeted by upscale finishes,
high ceilings, and the perfect floor plan.
Whether you're lounging in your private
backyard enclosed patio or taking a leisurely
stroll along the beach, you'll find endless
opportunities to soak up the beauty of Maui's
West Coast. And with short-term rental options
available, you can turn your dream vacation
home into a possible lucrative investment
opportunity.  Don't miss your chance to
experience Napili luxury living at its finest.
Schedule your showing today and discover
why The Residence at Napili Bay is the
epitome of island paradise! *Some personal
items are not included in the sale, the
inventory list will be provided

Built in 1993



Essential Information

MLS® # 402581

Price $1,750,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.50

Square Footage 1,431

Land Tenure Fee Simple

Acres 0.97

Year Built 1993

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Status Closed

Sold Price $1,750,000

Community Information

Address 5432 Lower Honapiilani Rd 1

Area Napili/Kahana/Honokowai

Subdivision Napili Gardens

City Napili/Kahana/Honokowai

State HI

Zip Code 96761

Condo Name The Residences at Napili Bay

Amenities

# of Garages 2

View Garden

Waterfront None

Vacation Rental No

Additional Information

Date Listed June 14th, 2024

Days on Market 118

HOA Fees Freq. Monthly

Monthly Maintenance Fee $990

Listing Details

Listing Office NextHome Hometown Realty Group

Listings provided courtesy of the REALTORS® Association of Maui. IDX information is provided exclusively for
consumers' personal, non-commercial use and may not be used for any purpose other than to identify prospective



properties consumers may be interested in purchasing. 


