
$1,920,000 - 54 Aekai Pl, Napili/Kahana/Honokowai
MLS® #400930 

$1,920,000
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 1,896 sqft
Residential on 0.22 Acres

Kapalani Estates, Napili/Kahana/Honokowai,
HI

Come see your beautiful Maui home with
spacious rooms and luxurious textures
throughout overlooking popular S-turns beach
in Kahana! Enjoy the breezy warmth and
ocean views from your meticulously cared for
single story home in the private and gated
Kapalani Estates neighborhood. Kapalani
Estates enjoys a community pool as well as
tennis courts, and private cabana with kitchen
for hosting parties. Ownership in Kapalani
Estates also includes 1/22 interest in the
on-site property manager's home. The monthly
maintenance fee includes pest control, trash,
water, sewer, tree trimming, and landscaping,
including your front and back yard! Your new
home is convenient to restaurants, shopping,
golf, hiking, and relaxing Maui sunsets. This is
it! Grab your favorite Realtor and check this
home out fast as it will go quickly.

Built in 2000

Essential Information

MLS® # 400930

Price $1,920,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Square Footage 1,896

Land Tenure Fee Simple

Acres 0.22

Year Built 2000



Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Sold Price $1,920,000

Community Information

Address 54 Aekai Pl

Area Napili/Kahana/Honokowai

Subdivision Kapalani Estates

City Napili/Kahana/Honokowai

State HI

Zip Code 96761

Amenities

Parking Garage, Garage Door Opener

# of Garages 2

View Ocean

Waterfront None

Vacation Rental No

Interior

Interior Features Ceiling Fan(s), Inventory, TV Cable

Appliances Dishwasher, Disposal, Dryer, Microwave, Range, Refrigerator, Washer

Cooling Central Air

Stories One

Exterior

Windows Blinds

Roof Monier Tile/Tile

Foundation Slab

Additional Information

Date Listed January 22nd, 2024

Days on Market 252

HOA Fees 3600

HOA Fees Freq. Quarterly

Listing Details

Listing Office Keller Williams Realty Maui-L
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