
$4,250,000 - 4194 Pilikai Rd, Anahola
MLS® #717489 

$4,250,000
5 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 3,539 sqft
Residential on 0.11 Acres

ANAHOLA, Anahola, HI

Sitting just above the turquoise waters of
Anahola Bay, this home captures the essence
of relaxed coastal living, elevated by the
sophistication of a thoughtfully refreshed
design. Offering unobstructed panoramic
ocean views, majestic mountain vistas, and
the rare benefit of a legal TVNC vacation
rental license, this is a unique opportunity for
those seeking both lifestyle and investment on
Kauaâ€˜iâ€™s cherished northeast
shore.<br><br>The residence has been
tastefully updated with fresh exterior paint,
modern vanities, and a collection of interior
enhancements that elevate both form and
function. Expansive picture windows and an
open-concept floor plan flood the home with
natural light, creating a seamless flow between
indoor comfort and the homeâ€™s
breathtaking natural
surroundings.<br><br>The great room frames
sweeping views of Anahola Bay, while the
primary suite offers a tranquil retreat with
cathedral ceilings, a walk-in closet, and a
spa-style en suite bathroom.  Step outside
onto the refinished Ipe deck, thoughtfully
designed for al fresco dining, lounging, grilling,
and enjoying the jacuzziâ€”all set against the
ever-changing canvas of sea and sky.  The
main level features three bedrooms and two
bathrooms, a dedicated laundry room, ample
storage, and a spacious media room that can
also serve as a fourth bedroom. A 5-unit
split-system air conditioning system ensures
year-round comfort throughout the



home.<br><br>With its exceptional location,
turnkey vacation rental potential, and refined
indoor-outdoor living, this property is a
timeless offering in one of Kauaâ€˜iâ€™s most
naturally stunning and beloved coastal
communities.

Built in 1979

Essential Information

MLS® # 717489

Price $4,250,000

Bedrooms 5

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 3

Square Footage 3,539

Acres 0.11

Year Built 1979

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 4194 Pilikai Rd

Subdivision ANAHOLA

City Anahola

State HI

Zip Code 96703

Amenities

Parking Unassigned

View Ocean

Interior

Appliances Dishwasher, Disposal, Dryer, Indoor Grill, Microwave, Range,
Refrigerator, Washer

Heating Zoned

Cooling Zoned

Exterior



Windows Blinds

Additional Information

Date Listed July 23rd, 2025

Days on Market 81

Zoning R-4

Listing Details

Listing Office Aloha Sotheby's Intl Realty - Kaua'i
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