
$1,085,000 - (unit #1) 57-101 Kuilima Drive, Kahuku
MLS® #202521012 

$1,085,000
1 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 738 sqft
Residential on 17.57 Acres

KUILIMA, Kahuku, HI

Escape to the North Shore with this fully
furnished 1-bedroom, 2-bath lock out unit at
Kuilima Estates West. Located within the North
Shore of Oahu's only approved Visitor
Destination Area, this home offers the unique
advantage of legal short-term rentalsâ€”ideal
for both personal enjoyment and investment.
Step inside and feel the light-filled, open floor
plan designed for comfort and relaxation that
also includes a private covered lanai creating
the perfect setting to unwind after a day in the
sun. Within the gated community, enjoy
resort-style amenities: two sparkling pools with
BBQ pavilions, tennis courts, lush walking
paths, ample guest parking, and 24-hour
security. Kuilima is surrounded by the
world-famous Ritz Carlton Oahu at the Turtle
Bay Resort, where youâ€™ll find
award-winning restaurants, two championship
golf courses, over five miles of scenic trails,
surf breaks just steps away, and beaches that
frame unforgettable sunsets and sunrises. This
is the true North Shore lifestyleâ€”ready for
you to experience.

Built in 1973

Essential Information

MLS® # 202521012

Price $1,085,000

Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 2.00



Full Baths 2

Square Footage 738

Acres 17.57

Year Built 1973

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #1) 57-101 Kuilima Drive

Area North Shore

Subdivision KUILIMA

City Kahuku

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96731

Condo Name Kuilima Ests West

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Assigned, Guest

View Garden

Has Pool Yes

Interior

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Double Wall

Additional Information

Days on Market 2

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $831

Listing Details

Listing Office Team Real Estate, Inc.
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