
$415,000 - (unit #802) 2630 Kapiolani Boulevard,
Honolulu
MLS® #202520582 

$415,000
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 717 sqft
Residential on 0.55 Acres

MOILIILI, Honolulu, HI

Located at 2630 Kapiolani Boulevard, Unit
802, this two-bedroom, one-bath condo offers
convenient city living on the eighth floor with
plenty of natural light and refreshing cross
breezes. The functional layout features a
comfortable living area that connects
seamlessly to the kitchen and dining space.
The popcorn ceiling has been removed,
creating a cleaner and more modern look.
Practical amenities include community laundry
located in the lobby and a covered parking
stall conveniently situated near the lobby
entrance. Maintenance fees cover water,
sewer, trash, and common expenses, making
day-to-day living simple and stress-free. This
secure building is close to schools, shopping,
dining, and bus lines, with Waikiki and Ala
Moana just minutes away. Perfect for first-time
buyers, investors, or anyone seeking a
low-maintenance home in Honolulu.

Built in 1975

Essential Information

MLS® # 202520582

Price $415,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 717



Acres 0.55

Year Built 1975

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style High Rise

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #802) 2630 Kapiolani Boulevard

Area Metro

Subdivision MOILIILI

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96826

Condo Name Plumeria Hale

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Assigned, Covered, One Space

View City

Exterior

Exterior Other

Additional Information

Days on Market 20

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $770

Listing Details

Listing Office Keller Williams Honolulu
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active listing, you may speak to one of our agents regarding your options for representation.


