
$376,000 - (unit #3105) 1088 Bishop Street, Honolulu
MLS® #202519744 

$376,000
1 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 543 sqft
Residential on 1.34 Acres

DOWNTOWN, Honolulu, HI

Fee Simple and spacious, this fully furnished 1
bed/1 bath/1 parking unit on the 31st floor of
Executive Centre offers convenience, views,
and investment potential. Floor-to-ceiling
windows highlight panoramic city, ocean and
harbor views. Currently in the Aston hotel
rental pool, this unit is an excellent opportunity
for investors or those seeking flexible urban
living. Building amenities include a heated
pool, 24-hr security, meeting spaces, and
secured covered parking. Step outside to the
heart of Downtown Honolulu with restaurants,
shops, entertainment, banks, and bus lines
just moments away. Situated in the financial
district, the property attracts business
travelers, visitors, and long-term residents
alike. The combination of fee simple
ownership, hotel rental income potential, and a
central location makes this a standout
opportunity in Honoluluâ€™s real estate
market.

Built in 1984

Essential Information

MLS® # 202519744

Price $376,000

Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 543

Acres 1.34



Year Built 1984

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style High Rise

Status Active Under Contract

Community Information

Address (unit #3105) 1088 Bishop Street

Area Metro

Subdivision DOWNTOWN

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96813

Condo Name Executive Centre

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Assigned, Garage

View Coastline, Mountain(s), Ocean, Sunset

Interior

Cooling Central Air

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Concrete

Additional Information

Days on Market 31

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $1,079

Listing Details

Listing Office Team Real Estate, Inc.
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active listing, you may speak to one of our agents regarding your options for representation.


