
$439,000 - (unit #c311) 46-267 Kahuhipa Street,
Kaneohe
MLS® #202518692 

$439,000
2 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 768 sqft
Residential on 4.47 Acres

WINDWARD ESTATES, Kaneohe, HI

Own Your Slice of Paradise at Windward
Acres â€” The Lowest Priced 2-Bedroom
Condo in the Building!  Welcome to Windward
Acres, where this spacious, top-floor corner
unit offers unmatched privacy and tranquility in
a serene neighborhood.  Conveniently located
just minutes from Windward Mall, military
bases, shopping, and freeway access, this
prime location puts everything you need within
easy reach.  This turnkey condo was upgraded
in 2025 with brand-new flooring, fresh paint
throughout, efficient window AC units, plus
modern kitchen and laundry
appliancesâ€”ready for you to move in and
relax.  Additional perks include covered
parking, extra storage, and low HOA fees,
making this an unbeatable value.  Eligible
buyers can benefit from an exceptional VA
assumable loan at just 2.25% interest!  All of
this is available for under $450K â€” the most
affordable 2-bedroom unit at Windward Acres. 
Donâ€™t miss your chance to own a true
piece of paradise!

Built in 1990

Essential Information

MLS® # 202518692

Price $439,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 1.00



Full Baths 1

Square Footage 768

Acres 4.47

Year Built 1990

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style Low Rise

Status Active Under Contract

Community Information

Address (unit #c311) 46-267 Kahuhipa Street

Area Kaneohe

Subdivision WINDWARD ESTATES

City Kaneohe

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96744

Condo Name Windward Acres

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Assigned, Covered, Guest, One Space, On Street

View Mountain(s)

Interior

Interior Features Storage

Stories One, Three Or More

Additional Information

Days on Market 49

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $603

Listing Details

Listing Office eXp Realty
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