
$680,000 - (unit #dh1401) 2215 Aloha Drive, Honolulu
MLS® #202518179 

$680,000
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,242 sqft
Residential on 0.00 Acres

WAIKIKI, Honolulu, HI

Beautifully renovated 2-bedroom, 2-bathroom
corner unit spanning 1,242 sq. ft. of living
space. 
Recent improvements include new vinyl
flooring throughout and complete removal of
the popcorn ceiling. 
The unit features an in-unit washer and dryer,
central A/C, and expansive windows in the
living room, primary bedroom, and second
bedroom, offering magnificent mountain views.
The maintenance fee is all-inclusive, covering
central A/C, electricity, cable/Wi-Fi, sewer,
water, hot water, and common area
maintenance. Building is fully insured. Situated
in Aloha Towers â€“ Diamond Head Tower,
residents enjoy amenities in both towers, such
as two heated pools (Ewa & Diamond Head
Towers), a whirlpool, sauna, barbecue /
recreation areas, ample guest parking, on-site
security, a car wash area, trash chute, and a
convenient mini-mart on the ground level.
Building is pet-friendly (please verify). 
Located in the heart of Waikiki, this prime
location offers easy access to everything
Waikiki has to offer.

Built in 1976

Essential Information

MLS® # 202518179

Price $680,000

Bedrooms 2



Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,242

Acres 0.00

Year Built 1976

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style High Rise

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #dh1401) 2215 Aloha Drive

Area Metro

Subdivision WAIKIKI

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96815

Condo Name Aloha Towers

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Covered, Guest, One Space

View City, Mountain(s), Canal

Has Pool Yes

Pool Heated

Interior

Cooling Central Air

Stories Three Or More

Exterior

Exterior Concrete

Additional Information

Days on Market 58

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $2,062

Listing Details



Listing Office Keller Williams Honolulu
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