
$565,000 - (unit #907) 909 Kapiolani Boulevard,
Honolulu
MLS® #202517748 

$565,000
1 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 603 sqft
Residential on 1.35 Acres

KAKAAKO, Honolulu, HI

**Open House: Sunday, Sep 21, 2â€“5 PM**.
Stylish 1-bedroom, 1-bath condo featuring
floor-to-ceiling windows with sweeping city and
mountain views. The open-concept layout
includes a modern kitchen with granite
countertops, stainless steel appliances, and
generous cabinetry, seamlessly flowing into
the living area. A private lanai extends the
living space outdoors, perfect for relaxing or
entertaining. The bright bedroom offers direct
access to the lanai, while the bathroom is
finished with contemporary fixtures. Additional
conveniences include split A/C, in-unit laundry,
and one covered parking stall. Enjoy a full
suite of amenities, including a pool, jacuzzi,
garden boxes, fitness center, BBQ area,
recreation room, and 24-hour security. Located
in the heart of Kaka'ako, walking distance to
Honolulu's largest shopping center, Ala
Moana, enjoy an array of dining options,
beaches, and entertainment; this residence
offers the ideal balance of comfort and urban
convenience.

Built in 2007

Essential Information

MLS® # 202517748

Price $565,000

Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 1.00



Full Baths 1

Square Footage 603

Acres 1.35

Year Built 2007

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style High Rise

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #907) 909 Kapiolani Boulevard

Area Metro

Subdivision KAKAAKO

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96814

Condo Name 909 Kapiolani

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking On Street, Assigned, Covered, Guest, One Space, Secured

View City, Mountain(s)

Interior

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Concrete

Additional Information

Days on Market 32

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $844

Listing Details

Listing Office Keller Williams Honolulu
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