
$597,700 - (unit #404) 458 Manawai Street, Kapolei
MLS® #202516827 

$597,700
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 828 sqft
Residential on 0.00 Acres

KAPOLEI-MEHANA-MANAWA, Kapolei, HI

Rare opportunity to own in one of West
Oahuâ€™s most sought-after planned
communities! Built by D.R. Horton, Manawa at
Mehana offers contemporary design, spacious
layouts, and the perfect blend of comfort and
convenience. This turnkey residence features
open-concept living, split A/C, upgraded
finishes, and a private lanai or yard
spaceâ€”ideal for relaxing or entertaining.
Investor-friendly and highly desirable, Manawa
at Mehana is part of a vibrant, pet-friendly, and
a neighborhood with strong rental demand.
Enjoy proximity to Ka Makana Aliâ€˜i Shopping
Center, UH West Oahu, Costco, Target,
schools, and the future rail station. Just
minutes from beaches, golf, and H-1 freeway
access.
Community amenities include: playgrounds
and a dog park, Mehana Activity Center (MAC)
with pool and gym access, and a
live-work-play vibe that attracts long-term
tenants and professionals alike.

Built in 2016

Essential Information

MLS® # 202516827

Price $597,700

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 828



Acres 0.00

Year Built 2016

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #404) 458 Manawai Street

Area Ewaplain

Subdivision KAPOLEI-MEHANA-MANAWA

City Kapolei

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96707

Condo Name Manawa at Mehana

Amenities

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Assigned, Two Spaces

View None

Interior

Interior Features BedroomOnMainLevel,FullBathOnMainLevel,Storage

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Double Wall, Masonry, Concrete, Stucco

School Information

Elementary Ho'okele

Middle Kapolei

High Kapolei

Additional Information

Days on Market 78

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $562

Listing Details

Listing Office Locations LLC
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