
$2,750,000 - 1062 Hoa Street, Honolulu
MLS® #202513561 

$2,750,000
5 Bedroom, 6.00 Bathroom, 4,196 sqft
Residential on 0.36 Acres

NAPALI HAWEO, Honolulu, HI

Enjoy breathtaking ocean and Diamond Head
views from this stunning executive home which
offers a blend of luxury, comfort, and privacy.
Perfect for a multi-generational household or
someone looking for a separate rental unit.
The top floor features an open-concept layout
with a large marble island, expansive walk-in
pantry, and seamless flow to indoor/outdoor
entertaining spaces. The middle level features
3 en suite bedrooms, a family room, and
laundry room. The lower level, with separate
entry, features 1 bed, 1 bath and is ideal for
guests or ohana living. Steel framed
construction. Relax by the private pool or
unwind on multiple lanais while soaking in the
views. Napali Haweo offers 24-hour security.
Minutes to shopping, dining, and beaches. 3
car garage plus enough driveway space for a
few more cars. An owned PV system features
39 panels and 6 storage batteries ensures
energy efficiency. A rare opportunity to own a
tranquil island retreat in a prestigious setting.

Built in 1998

Essential Information

MLS® # 202513561

Price $2,750,000

Bedrooms 5

Bathrooms 6.00

Full Baths 5

Half Baths 2



Square Footage 4,196

Acres 0.36

Year Built 1998

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Detached

Status Active

Community Information

Address 1062 Hoa Street

Area HawaiiKai

Subdivision NAPALI HAWEO

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96825

Amenities

Utilities Cable Available, Electricity Available, High Speed Internet Available,
Other, Sewer Available, Underground Utilities, Water Available

Parking Spaces 6

Parking Driveway, Garage, Three or more Spaces, On Street, Boat

View Coastline, Garden, Mountain(s), Ocean, Sunset

Pool Heated, In Ground, Pool, Tile

Interior

Interior Features BedroomOnMainLevel,FullBathOnMainLevel

Stories Three Or More

Exterior

Exterior Double Wall, Masonry, Concrete, Steel Frame, Stucco

Additional Information

Days on Market 125

HOA Fees 130

Lease Fee $0

Listing Details

Listing Office 20 Degrees North Real Estate
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