
$215,000 - (unit #1616) 410 Atkinson Drive, Honolulu
MLS® #202511751 

$215,000
0 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 297 sqft
Residential on 0.00 Acres

ALA MOANA, Honolulu, HI

Seize Your Hawaiian Dream â€“ Where
Adventure Meets Profit!
Picture this: Youâ€™re the proud owner of a
jaw-dropping condotel thatâ€™s your golden
ticket to paradise AND a money-making
machine! Perched right beside the legendary
Ala Moana Shopping Centerâ€”the worldâ€™s
largest open-air playground of retail and
diningâ€”youâ€™re at the epicenter of it all.
Feel the thrill of stepping out your door to Ala
Moana Beach Park, where turquoise waves
crash and golden sands beckon, or zip over to
Waikikiâ€™s electric vibes in just 5
heart-pounding minutes!
This isnâ€™t just a propertyâ€”itâ€™s a
high-octane lifestyle with a twist of genius. Ala
Moana Condotel, itâ€™s your private slice of
island bliss one day, and a cash-flowing rental
rocket the next. Crave flexibility? Stay
whenever your soul demands it, then let it rake
in the dough when youâ€™re off conquering
the world. With the Hawaii Convention Center
nearby, this hotspot draws business travelers!
Why dream small when you can live BIG? This
condotel is your launchpad to luxury and
wealth in one of Oahuâ€™s most electrifying
locations. Act fastâ€”this isnâ€™t just an
opportunity; itâ€™s a life-altering, pulse-racing
steal! Your Hawaiian empire awaitsâ€”grab it
NOW!

Built in 1970

Essential Information



MLS® # 202511751

Price $215,000

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 297

Acres 0.00

Year Built 1970

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style High Rise

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #1616) 410 Atkinson Drive

Area Metro

Subdivision ALA MOANA

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96814

Condo Name ala moana hotel condo

Amenities

Parking None, Valet

View City, Ocean

Has Pool Yes

Exterior

Exterior Concrete

Additional Information

Days on Market 156

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $1,314

Listing Details

Listing Office HBR LLC
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