
$397,500 - (unit #1006) 419 Atkinson Drive, Honolulu
MLS® #202506945 

$397,500
1 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 558 sqft
Residential on 0.00 Acres

ALA MOANA, Honolulu, HI

Nicely done 1 bdrm with parking over looking
ocean views with stunning sunsets over
Waikiki and Ala Wai Harbor.  Located adjacent
to Ala Moana Shopping Ctr, and across from
Ala Moana beach park & Magic Island. Unit is
move in ready has been painted also bamboo
flooring, and furnished w/queen bed set
includes headboard,footboard, memory foam
mattress, 2 end tables,2 lamps, fullsize
dresser. Bed has drawers underneath for more
storage.  Livingroom has 60" Samsung Smart
TV, recliner sofa w/auto leg lifts, and a cute
dining set with 4 padded chairs. Kitchen has
brand new Samsung Bespoke appliances
which include a refrigerator w/filtered water in
the door, 2 diff. ice cube makers, a stove/oven,
a full size microwave oven, and dishwasher as
well as a Nespresso coffee maker. All
plumbing fixtures are also brand new so
nothing more for you to do.  A sizeable patio to
enjoy sunsets over Waikiki every evening.
Custom floor to ceiling aluminum storm
shutters. One parking stall and storage unit in
garage. This unit has one of lowest
maintenance fees in bldg. with a FOB entry
key plus pet friendly bldg.  Seller Motivated!
  Tenant has finally moved out and very easy
to show with Lockbox.

Built in 1969

Essential Information

MLS® # 202506945



Price $397,500

Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 558

Acres 0.00

Year Built 1969

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style High Rise

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #1006) 419 Atkinson Drive

Area Metro

Subdivision ALA MOANA

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96814

Condo Name Sunset Towers

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Assigned, One Space

View Ocean, Other, Sunset

Has Pool Yes

Interior

Interior Features Storage

Exterior

Exterior Concrete

Additional Information

Days on Market 213

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $858

Listing Details



Listing Office Coldwell Banker Island Prop
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