
$2,399,000 - 91-020 Popoi Place, Ewa Beach
MLS® #202505644 

$2,399,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,658 sqft
Residential on 0.27 Acres

EWA BEACH, Ewa Beach, HI

Imagine walking hand in hand on a white
sandy beach in Hawaii. This One-of-a-kind
property is located on a beautiful beach with a
massive yard. Enjoy stunning ocean, sunset,
and Diamond Head views. Relax on your open
air deck to soak in the views and let your
stress melt away under the garden lights at
night. Palm trees line the perimeter of the
property for a tropical feel. This home is a four
bedroom, 3.5 bath home with two primary
suites. 33 panel PV panels leased, solar water
heater, and standby generator for your power
needs. Huge storage rooms for your surf
boards and kayaks. Located on a cul-de-sac
and you have privacy with Pualoa Park on one
side and two smaller homes on the other side.
Two car garage and large driveway that
accommodates 6+ cars. Ewa Golf Course is
right across the street.

Built in 1946

Essential Information

MLS® # 202505644

Price $2,399,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 3

Square Footage 2,658

Acres 0.27

Year Built 1946



Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Detached

Status Active

Community Information

Address 91-020 Popoi Place

Area Ewaplain

Subdivision EWA BEACH

City Ewa Beach

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96706

Amenities

Utilities Above Ground Utilities, Cable Available, Electricity Available, High
Speed Internet Available, Sewer Available, Water Available

Parking Spaces 3

Parking Garage, Driveway, On Street, Three or more Spaces

View Ocean, Coastline, Sunset

Is Waterfront Yes

Waterfront Waterfront,Oceanfront

Pool None

Interior

Interior Features BedroomOnMainLevel,FullBathOnMainLevel

Stories Two

Exterior

Exterior Double Wall, Concrete, Brick, Single Wall, Wood Frame

Additional Information

Days on Market 229

Lease Fee $0

Listing Details

Listing Office Keller Williams Honolulu
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