
$500,000 - (unit #518) 134 Kapahulu Avenue, Honolulu
MLS® #202501990 

$500,000
0 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 363 sqft
Residential on 0.17 Acres

WAIKIKI, Honolulu, HI

Welcome to the Waikiki Grand Hotel, where
prime location meets exceptional investment
opportunity! This legal short-term rental is
situated on the highly sought-after Kapiolani
Park and Honolulu Zoo side of Waikiki, offering
unparalleled convenience and stunning
surroundings. Boasting one of the larger
floorplans in the development, this
well-maintained unit is perfectly suited for
investors or those seeking a versatile
investment/user property.

A standout feature of this unit is its interior
door connecting to the adjoining Unit #519,
which is also available for sale. Together,
these units can be combined to create one of
the largest living spaces in the buildingâ€”ideal
for maximizing income potential or enjoying an
expansive Waikiki retreat.

With a proven history of high occupancy and
thriving rental income, this property is a rare
find in a premier Waikiki location. Donâ€™t
miss the chance to own a piece of paradise
with endless possibilities. Schedule your
showing today!

Built in 1963

Essential Information

MLS® # 202501990

Price $500,000



Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 363

Acres 0.17

Year Built 1963

Type Residential

Sub-Type Condominium

Style High Rise

Status Active

Community Information

Address (unit #518) 134 Kapahulu Avenue

Area Metro

Subdivision WAIKIKI

City Honolulu

County Oahu

State HI

Zip Code 96815

Condo Name Waikiki Grand Hotel

Amenities

Parking On Street

View City

Has Pool Yes

Interior

Stories Three Or More

Exterior

Exterior Concrete

Additional Information

Days on Market 270

Lease Fee $0

Monthly Maintenance Fee $1,196

Listing Details

Listing Office Compass
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