
$569,000 - 15-1663 Beach Rd, Keaau
MLS® #719370 

$569,000
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 1,536 sqft
Residential on 0.56 Acres

HAWAIIAN PARADISE PARK, Keaau, HI

Great opportunity to own a home in the Kaloli
Point area of Hawaiian Paradise Park.  This 3
bedroom, 3 bath spacious home sits on over
half an acre of land (24,394 sqft) with a
generous 1,536 sqft of interior living space and
thoughtful touches throughout.<br><br>Built in
2005, this two-story home offers a smart layout
with a bright, open living area, vaulted ceilings,
and plenty of natural light. The kitchen
features a brand-new range and microhood. 
The first floor den adds extra flexibilityâ€”ideal
as a home office, reading nook, or guest
space.<br><br>Enjoy the island breeze from
the second-floor lanai.  Storage is no issue
with multiple storage rooms in the 2-car
enclosed garage, plus a dedicated laundry
area for added
convenience.<br><br>Additional features
include:<br><br>-Floors are Medallion
Easylock Exotic Wood Floating Floor - Santos
Mahogany<br>-CAT 6 ethernet wiring for fast,
reliable connectivity<br>-Palm-lined
driveway<br>-Enclosed garage with extra
storage options<br><br>Paved roads leading
to the property and easy access to the
coastline. <br><br>Donâ€™t miss the chance
to own this slice of paradiseâ€”move-in ready
and full of potential!<br><br>**Placement of
boundary lines in photos is approximate. Exact
location of property boundaries should be
verified by a licensed surveyor.

Built in 2005



Essential Information

MLS® # 719370

Price $569,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 3

Square Footage 1,536

Acres 0.56

Year Built 2005

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 15-1663 Beach Rd

Subdivision HAWAIIAN PARADISE PARK

City Keaau

State HI

Zip Code 96749

Amenities

Parking Attached

Interior

Appliances Dishwasher, Disposal, Dryer, Microwave Hood, Range, Refrigerator,
Washer

Additional Information

Date Listed March 17th, 2025

Days on Market 210

Zoning A-1A

Listing Details

Listing Office Savio Realty Ltd. - Hilo Office
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