
$349,000 - 15-1672 28th Ave, Keaau
MLS® #718845 

$349,000
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,826 sqft
Residential on 1.00 Acres

HAWAIIAN PARADISE PARK, Keaau, HI

Privacy abounds on this 1 acre lot in the
Hawaiian Paradise Park Subdivision! The
home is NOT visible from the street and.....
there's a cool lava tube feature on site as
well!<br>3 bedrooms, 1 Full bathroom and 1
half bathroom inside the home AND 1 half
bathroom with a toilet and shower conveniently
located in the Outdoor Storage/ Laundry room.
<br>Easy access located at the top of the
subdivision and on a paved
road!<br><br>Plenty of room to grow your own
food and lots of parking area and a large 2-car
carport!<br><br>This unique dome home is an
exceptional value with over 1,800 square feet
of living area!! The kitchen was recently
updated with brand new cabinets, vinyl
flooring, counter tops & all stainless steel
appliances.<br><br>So much potential here!
NOT a cookie cutter home to be sure!

Built in 1982

Essential Information

MLS® # 718845

Price $349,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 1

Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,826

Acres 1.00



Year Built 1982

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 15-1672 28th Ave

Subdivision HAWAIIAN PARADISE PARK

City Keaau

State HI

Zip Code 96749

Amenities

Parking Covered

Interior

Interior Features High Ceilings, Vaulted Ceiling(s)

Appliances Dishwasher, Range, Refrigerator

Heating None

Cooling None

Exterior

Lot Description Wooded

Additional Information

Date Listed February 28th, 2025

Days on Market 228

Zoning A-1A

Listing Details

Listing Office Team Hawaii Realty
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